
Short title and
commencement.

THE NARCOTIC DRUGS AND PSYCHOTROPIC SUBSTANCES
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2014

(NO. 16 OF 2014)
[7th March, 2014.]

An Act further to amend the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances
Act, 1985.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances
(Amendment) Act, 2014.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. In section 2 of the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances Act, 1985  (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act),—

(a) after clause (iv), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(iva) “Central Government factories” means factories owned by the Central
Government or factories owned  by any company in which the Central Government
holds at least fifty-one per cent. of the paid-up share capital;’;

(b) clause (viiia) shall be relettered as clause (viiib) and before, clause (viiib) as
so relettered, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(viiia) “essential narcotic drug” means a narcotic drug notified by the
Central Government for medical and scientific use;’.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 2.

61  of 1985.

jftLVªh lañ Mhñ ,yñ—(,u)04@0007@2003—14 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—14

vlk/kkj.k
EXTRAORDINARY
Hkkx  II —  [k.M 1

PART II — Section 1
izkf/kdkj ls izdkf'kr

PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

lañ 17] ubZ fnYyh] lkseokj] ekpZ 10] 2014@ QkYxqu 19] 1935 ¼'kd½
No. 17]  NEW DELHI, MONDAY, MARCH 10, 2014/PHALGUNA 19, 1935 (SAKA)

bl Hkkx esa fHkUu i`"B la[;k nh tkrh gS ftlls fd ;g vyx ladyu ds :i esa j[kk tk ldsA
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 10th March, 2014/Phalguna 19, 1935 (Saka)

The following Act of Parliament received the assent of the President on the
7th March, 2014, and is hereby published for general information:—



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

3. In section 4 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the words “the illicit traffic therein’’, the words “and
for ensuring their medical and scientific use” shall be inserted;

(b) in sub-section (2), after clause (d), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(da) availability of narcotic drugs and psychotropic substances for
medical and scientific use;”.

4. In section 9 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), in clause (a),—

(i) after sub-clause (iii), the following sub-clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(iiia) the possession, transport, import inter-State, export inter-
State, warehousing, sale, purchase, consumption and use of poppy straw
produced from plants from which no juice has been extracted through
lancing;”.

(ii) after sub-clause (v), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

(va) the manufacture, possession, transport, import inter-State, export
inter-State, sale, purchase, consumption and use of essential narcotic
drugs:

Provided that where, in respect of an essential narcotic drug, the
State Government has granted licence or permit under the provisions of
section 10 prior to the commencement of the Narcotic Drugs and
Psychotropic Substances (Amendment) Act, 2014, such licence or permit
shall continue to be valid till the date of its expiry or for a period of twelve
months from such commencement, whichever is earlier.”;

(b) in sub-section (2), after clause (h), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(ha) prescribe the forms and conditions of licences or permits for the
manufacture, possession, transport, import inter-State, export inter-State, sale,
purchase, consumption or use of essential narcotic drugs, the authorities by
which such licence or permit may be granted and the fees that may be charged
therefor;”.

5. In section 10 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (a),—

(a) in sub-clause (i), after the words ‘‘poppy straw”, the words “except poppy
straw produced from plants from which no juice has been extracted through lancing”
shall be inserted;

(b) in sub-clause (v), for the words “manufactured drugs other than prepared
opium”, the words and brackets “manufactured drugs (other than prepared opium and
essential narcotic drugs)’’ shall be inserted.

6. In section 15 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for the words “six months”, the words
“one year” shall be substituted.

7. In section 17 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for the words “six months”, the words
“one year” shall be substituted.

8. In section 18 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for the words “six months”, the words
“one year” shall be substituted.

9. In section 20 of the principal Act, in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in item (A), for the
words “six months”, the words “one year” shall be substituted.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 4.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 9.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 10.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 15.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 17.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 18.

A m e n d m e n t
of section 20.



SEC. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 3

10. In section 21 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted.

11. In section 22 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted.

12. In section 23 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted.

13.  After section 27A of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

‘‘27B. Whoever contravenes the provision of section 8A shall be punishable
with rigorous imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than three years but
which may extend to ten years and shall also be liable to fine.’’.

14. In section 31 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words ‘‘one-half of the maximum term’’, the words ‘‘one and one-
half times of the maximum term’’ shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words ‘‘one-half of the maximum amount’’, the words ‘‘one and
one-half times of the maximum amount’’ shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words ‘‘one-half of the minimum term’’, the words ‘‘one and one-
half times of the minimum term’’ shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words ‘‘one-half of the minimum amount’’, the words ‘‘one and
one-half times of the minimum amount’’ shall be substituted.

15. In section 31A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “shall be
punishable with death”, the words and figures “shall be punished with punishment which
shall not be less than the punishment specified in section 31 or with death” shall be substituted.

16. In section 42 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in the proviso, for the words
“Provided that”, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that in respect of holder of a licence for manufacture of manufactured drugs
or psychotropic substances or controlled substances granted under this Act or any rule or
order made thereunder, such power shall be exercised by an officer not below the rank of
sub-inspector:

Provided further that”.

17. In section 52A of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

‘‘(1) The Central Government may, having regard to the hazardous nature,
vulnerability to theft, substitution, constraint of proper storage space or  any
other relevant consideration, in respect of any narcotic drugs, psychotropic
substances, controlled substances or conveyances, by notification in the Official
Gazette, specify such narcotic drugs, psychotropic substances, controlled
substances or conveyance or class of narcotic drugs, class of psychotropic
substances, class of controlled substances or conveyances, which shall, as
soon as may be after their seizure, be disposed of by such  officer and in such
manner as that Government may, from time to time, determine after following the
procedure hereinafter specified.’’;

Amendment
of section 21.

Amendment
of section 22.

Insertion of
new section
27B.

Punishment
for
contravention
of section 8A.

Amendment
of section 31.

Amendment
of section 23.

Amendment
of section
31A.

Amendment
of section
52A.

Amendment
of section 42.



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

Amendment
of section
68D.

Insertion of
new section
57A.

Report of
seizure of
property of
the person
arrested by the
notified officer.

Substitution of
new heading
for heading of
Chapter VA.

Amendment
of section
68B.

(b) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words "narcotic drug or psychotropic substance" and "narcotic
drugs or psychotropic substances", wherever they occur, the words "narcotic
drugs, psychotropic substances, controlled substances or conveyances" shall
be substituted;

(ii) in clause (b), for the words "such drugs or substances", the words
"such drugs, substances or conveyances" shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (4),  for the words "narcotic drugs or psychotropic substances",
the words "narcotic drugs, psychotropic substances, controlled substances or
conveyances" shall be substituted.

18. After section 57 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

"57A. Whenever any officer notified under section 53 makes an arrest or seizure
under this Act, and the provisions of Chapter VA apply to any person involved in the
case of such arrest or seizure, the officer shall make a report of the illegally acquired
properties of such person to the jurisdictional competent authority within ninety days
of the arrest or seizure.".

19. In Chapter VA of the principal Act, for the heading "FORFEITURE OF PROPERTY DERIVED

FROM, OR USED IN ILLICIT TRAFFIC", the heading "FORFEITURE OF ILLEGALLY ACQUIRED PROPERTY"
shall be substituted.

20. In section 68B of the principal Act,—

(a) in clause (g),—

(i) in sub-clause (i), for the words "of this Act; or", the words "of this Act
or the equivalent value of such property; or" shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the words "such property,", the words "such
property or the equivalent value of such property; or" shall be substituted;

(iii) after sub-clause (ii), the following sub-clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

"(iii) any property acquired by such person, whether before or after
the commencement of the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances
(Amendment) Act, 2014, wholly or partly out of or by means of any income,
earnings or assets the source of which cannot be proved, or the equivalent
value of such property;";

(b) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

'(h) "property" means any property or assets of every description, whether
corporeal or incorporeal, movable or immovable, tangible or intangible, wherever
located and includes deeds and instruments evidencing title to, or interest in,
such property or assets;'.

21. In section 68D of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words "any Collector
of Customs or Collector of Central Excise", the words "any Commissioner of Customs or
Commissioner of Central Excise" shall be substituted.

22. In section 68H of the principal Act, the following Explanation shall be inserted at
the end, namely:—

"Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that in a case
where the provisions of section 68J are applicable, no notice under this section shall
be invalid merely on the ground that it fails to mention the evidence relied upon or it
fails to establish a direct nexus between the property sought to be forfeited and any
activity in contravention of the provisions of this Act.".

Amendment
of section
68H.



SEC. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 5

23. In section 68-O of the principal Act, in  sub-section (4),  after the proviso, the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

"Provided further that if the office of the Chairman is vacant by reason of his
death, resignation or otherwise, or if the Chairman is unable to discharge his duties
owing to absence, illness or any other cause, the Central  Government may, by order,
nominate any member to act as the Chairman until a new Chairman is appointed and
assumes charge or, as the case may be, resumes his duties.’’.

24. In section 71 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “The Government
may, in its discretion, establish, as many centres as it thinks fit for identification, treatment”,
the words ‘‘The Government may establish, recognise or approve as many centres as it
thinks fit for identification, treatment, management” shall be substituted.

————

P.K. MALHOTRA,
Secy. to the Govt. of  India.

Amendment of
section 68-O.

Amendment
of section 71.

GMGIPMRND—4857GI(GI)—10-03-2014.

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD,  NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF  PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2014.



<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


